

CITY OF RIALTO

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

Bid Number:	18-056
Bid Due Date:	2/22/2018
Vendors Solicited:	355

VENDOR		Advantage Business Forms	Geographics		Little Bear Productions		The PM Group		Pat Davis Design Group		The Sauce		Southwest Offset Printing Co.
PHONE		(909) 875-7163	(951) 369-1564		(909) 210-9679		(949) 597-1662		(916) 563-7148		(626) 217-4662		(310) 323-6927
LOCATION		Rialto, CA	Riverside, CA		Etiwanda, CA		Lake Forest, CA		Sacramento, CA		Monrovia, CA		Gardena, CA
CONTACT		ksabo@abfprints.com	lisa@geomail.info		graphics@lbstudios.com		paulm@pmgrp.net		sales@pddesign.com		admin@thesauce.com		a.spear@southwestoffset.com
Option A: Graphic design cost to consult, design, layout, & produce		Pg #	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design	Graphic Design
Winter Edition - design	80	No bid	\$56.88	\$4,550.40	\$122.00	\$9,760.00	\$80.00	\$6,400.00	\$100.00	\$8,000.00	\$65.00	\$5,200.00	No bid
Additional charges			\$410.00		\$75 per hour		\$75 per hour		\$0.00		\$0.00		
Calendar - design	16	No bid	\$65.63	\$1,050.08	\$122.00	\$1,952.00	\$175.00	\$2,800.00	\$100.00	\$1,600.00	\$100.00	\$1,600.00	No bid
Additional charges			\$180.00		\$75 per hour		\$75 per hour		\$0.00		\$0.00		
Summer Edition - design	80	No bid	\$56.88	\$4,550.40	\$122.00	\$9,760.00	\$80.00	\$6,400.00	\$100.00	\$8,000.00	\$65.00	\$5,200.00	No bid
Additional charges			\$410.00		\$75 per hour		\$75 per hour		\$0.00		\$0.00		
Fall Edition - design	80	No bid	\$56.88	\$4,550.40	\$122.00	\$9,760.00	\$80.00	\$6,400.00	\$100.00	\$8,000.00	\$65.00	\$5,200.00	No bid
Additional charges			\$410.00		\$75 per hour		\$75 per hour		\$0.00		\$0.00		
Subtotal (less additional hourly charges)			\$16,111.28		\$31,232.00		\$22,000.00		\$25,600.00		\$17,200.00		
Additional Proofs (over 2)							\$45 per hour						
Changes in pages (increase/decrease)							\$70 per page magazine \$125 per page calendar						

Additional Images/Photography					\$10 per page magazine \$25 per page calendar			
Complete re-design required					\$1,000-\$2,000			
Revisions to final proof					\$75-125 per hour			
Online version of calendar					\$125.00			
Maximum completion/delivery time			49 days	49 days	35 days	15 days	30-40 days	

Option B: Printing, production and saturation distribution		Print Cost <i>less postage & tax</i>	Print Cost <i>less postage & tax</i>	Print Cost <i>less postage & tax</i>	Print Cost <i>less postage & tax</i>	Print Cost <i>less postage & tax</i>	Print Cost <i>less postage & tax</i>	Print Cost <i>less postage & tax</i>
Winter Edition - print		\$26,362.50	\$14,860.00	No bid	\$23,682.00	No bid	\$15,567.70	\$13,617.00
Calendar - print		\$8,027.50	\$13,739.00	No bid	\$15,753.00	No bid	\$17,110.60	\$9,967.00
Summer Edition - print		\$24,624.00	\$17,681.00	No bid	\$23,682.00	No bid	\$19,870.38	\$13,617.00
Fall Edition - print		\$24,624.00	\$17,681.00	No bid	\$23,682.00	No bid	\$19,870.38	\$13,617.00
Maximum completion/delivery time		10 working days	14 working days		10-12 working days		7-10 days	10 working days
Subtotal		\$83,638.00	\$63,961.00		\$86,799.00		\$72,419.06	\$50,818.00

*Note: prices above include
a 5% local vendor
preference discount*