CITY OF RIALTO
ABSTRACT OF BIDS

Bid Number:
Bid Due Date:

Vendors Solicitated:

20-023

10/16/2019

355

VENDOR LN Curtis & Sons Municipal Emergency Services Allstar Fire Equip.
PHONE (510) 839-5111 (714) 313-8461 (626) 652-0900
LOCATION Oakland, CA San Diego, CA Arcadia, CA
CONTACT Jeffery R. Curtis Jeremy Walters John Sprengelmeyer
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTy. UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
1 1101-0040 - Mohawk NFPA 4
Escape/Ladder* Belt: 28-48 No Bid S 140.12 | S 560.48 | $ 148.40 | S 593.60
1101-0090.02 - Multi-Use Strap-
2 |Aluminum Carabiner 4
(Twist Lock) S 10455 | $ 41820 | S 98.74 | S 39496 | S 104.55 | $ 418.20
3 |11 01-0080 - Belt Accessory Pouch 4 1S 2220 | S 88.80 ]S 2097 | S 83.88 ]S 2360 | S 94.40
4 ]1105-0066 - Swivel Axe/Tool Clip: Female 4 S 40.95 | ¢ 163.80 | ¢ 3871 | ¢ 154.84 | ¢ 4355 | ¢ 174.20
5 1105-0020.45 - Full Leather Scabbard: 4
Right 45° S 95.90 | $ 383.60| S 90.66 | S 362.64 | S 96.00 | $ 384.00
Amerex - p/n 240 / 2.5 gallon water
6 [|extinguisher with hose and 1
nozzle grip S 96.00 | S 96.00 No Bid S 113.00 | $ 113.00
Amerex - p/n B456 / 10 Ib Hand Portable
7 |Dry Chemical, ABC with 1
Hose and Horn S 63.25( S 63.25 No Bid S 80.80| $ 80.80
Firehooks - p/n CH-312 / Can Harness
8 |Extinguisher Carrying 1
System S 4750 | S 47.50 No Bid S 60.00 | $ 60.00
9 22-890900G2-150 DUAL DEADMANBAG 1
CONTROLLER G2 S 719.50 | S 719.50 | No Bid No Bid
10 22890300G2150 MASTER CONTROL KIT 1
G2, CONSISTING OF: S 3,39530|S$ 3,395.30 | No Bid No Bid
* 1 EA. 22-895401 G2 PRESSURE 1
REGULATOR Included
* 4 EA. 22-890490-150 INLINE 4
RELIEF VALVE Included
* 2 EA. 22-890682 1/4" NPT F )
PARATECH NIPPLE Included
* 4 EA. 22-890686 PARATECH 4
NIPPLE FOR ALB 3/8-24 LH THD Included
* 1 EA. 22-890731 PARATECH 1
NIPPLE & LOCKING TIRE CHUCK Included
* 1 EA. 22-890732 SHUTOFF
ADAPTER NIPPLE X INDUSTRIAL NIPPLE 1
WITH VALVE Included
* 2 EA. 22-890736 'Y' WITH 2 )
COUPLINGS & 1 NIPPLE Included
* 1 EA. 22-890749 SHUTOFF 1
ADAPTER NIPPLE WITH TWIST LOCK Included
* 1 EA. 22-890513 BLACK 3/8" X 16' 1
AIR HOSE Included
* 1 EA. 22-890514 BLUE 3/8" X 16' 1
AIR HOSE Included




* 1 EA. 22-890515 YELLOW 3/8" X

16' AIR HOSE ! Included
* 1 EA. 22-890516 RED 3/8" X 16' 1
AIR HOSE Included
* 1 EA. 22-890517 GREEN 3/8" X 16' 1
AIR HOSE Included
* 1 EA. 22-890322 MASTER 1
CONTROL KIT CASE Included
11 22890490150 PARA INLINE RELIEF VALVE- 10
165PSI S 166.25 166.25 | No Bid No Bid
12 2288811 0OG2 PARA KPI1 1.5 TON MAXI )
FORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 376.20 752.40 | No Bid No Bid
13 22888120G2 PARA KPI3 3.5 TON )
MAXIFORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 497.80 995.60 | No Bid No Bid
14 22888130G2 PARA KPI5 5.4 TON )
MAXIFORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 669.75 1,339.50 | No Bid No Bid
15 22888140G2 PARA KPI12 13.7 TON MAXI )
FORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 874.00 1,748.00 | No Bid No Bid
16 22888150G2 PARA KPI17 19 TON 1
MAXIFORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 930.05 930.05 | No Bid No Bid
17 22888165G2 PARA KPI28 34 TON 1
MAXIFORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 1,242.60 1,242.60 | No Bid No Bid
18 22888180G2 PARA KPI35L 39.5 TON MAXI 1
FORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 1,502.90 1,502.90 | No Bid No Bid
19 22888190G2 PARA KPl44 52.7 TON 1
MAXIFORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 2,071.00 2,071.00 | No Bid No Bid
20 22888200G2 PARA KPI174 89.2 TON )
MAXIFORCE AIR LIFTING BAG S 2,963.05 5,926.10 | No Bid No Bid
21 22890800 PARA OPERATIONS MANUAL 1
FOR BAG & CONTROL PACKAGE . .
Included No Bid No Bid
22 (22889351 G2150 END PKG 1 S 21,574.50 21,574.50 | No Bid No Bid
23 CUSTOM TURTLE PLASTICS: (USAR CRIB 1
KIT B) S 2,996.00 2,996.00 | $ No Bid
500330 CMC FR WEB ESCAPE SYSTEM-
24 |CONSISTING 1
OF: S 495.00 495.00] S S 452.95 452.95
11 MM ESCAPE WEB WITH CMC 1 Included
FACTORY SEWN TERMINATION 1 Included
lea CMC SINGLE BRAKE ESCAPE 1
ARTIST Included
lea FLASH HOOK ESCAPE ANCHOR 1
Included
1 ea FR ESCAPE BAG 1 Included
lea TETHER WITH 1-QUICK LINK 1 Included
lea CMC PROTECH MANUAL LOCK 1
CARABINER Included
* UL CLASSIFIED TO NFPA 1983 1 Included
25 2F06X50W07GHB 5/8X50' CPLD .75GHT 1
CB White SJ QUIK DRAW HOSE S 33.00 33.00 | No Bid S 49.00 49.00
26 1030G UFS .75GHT RED 22GPM POLY 1
COMBI NOZZLE S 12.00 12.00 | No Bid S 19.00 19.00
27 CONE, 28 INCH, 7LB, ORANGE, 4 INCH x 6 10
INCH COLOR, 102713 S 16.00 160.00 | No Bid No Bid
78 CTC6003 RESUCE 42, TC STRUT RESCUE 1
KIT CONSISTING OF: S 10,519.00 10,519.00 | No Bid No Bid




4 ea LONG STRUT WITH COMBI-
HEAD & BASEPLATE

4 ea SHORT STRUT WITH COMBI-
HEAD & BASEPLATE

8 ea 27’ STRAPS, 2 SCREW-JEACK
HEAD

1 ea A-FRAME HEAD WITH 3 PINS, 2
SPIKE FEET

2 ea HOOK CLUSTER, 2 CINCH RING

17 ea YELLOW STUT PINS, 9 BASE
PINS

2 ea ACCESSORY BAG AND
INSTRUCTIONAL DVD

JUMBO LOK WITH BLACK STRAP, #10701-

029 |5 peRF ADV 161 59.80 |$  956.80 | No Bid $ 5285 (¢  845.60
LARGE COLLAPSIBLE STEP CHOCK SER,
30 |INCLUDES: 2 ea 16” COLLAPSIBLE STEP 3
CHOCKS, #SRK-L2 RESCUE 42 $  759.00|$  2,277.00 | NoBid No Bid
JUNIOR ENGINE COMBO INCLUDING: 2 ea
5, |TELECRIBJUNIOR STRUTS, 1 pr SHARK .
JUNIOR STEP CHOCKS, #CTC-1002 RESUCE
42 $ 302100 |$ 12,084.00 | No Bid No Bid
5, |BLACK LADDER STABILIZATION KIT, #LSKA |
TUR $  24900|$  747.00 | NoBid No Bid
43 |BLACK4"X4"X 18" LINCOLN LOG, 2
#441118 TUR $ 3465  693.00]$ 3079 |$  615.80 | NoBid
1 | TELEBRIB JUNIOR SRUT MOUNTING
BRACKET, #CTC-1020 RESCUE 42 No Bid No Bid
35 |CARRYING BAG 24” x 17" X 16", #CBTUR | 1 : s0sa|s 8054 | nosid
RESCUE TU28K GRIPHOIST,
36 |GRIPHOIST/TIRFOR TU28K RESCUE KIT - 1
CONSISTING OF: $  2,24000|$  2,240.00 | No Bid No Bid
* STEEL BOX
*TU28 GRIPHOIST/TIRFOR
* 6OFT. OF GALVANIZED WIRE ROPE
WITH SAFETY HOOK MOUNTED ON
CARRYING REEL
* TELESCOPIC HANDLE FOR MANUAL
OPERATION OF THE HOIST
* APPROPRIATE SNATCH BLOCK
PULLEY
* 1ea. 6FTWIRE ROPE SLING WITH
CHOKER HOOK
* 1ea. 6FTWIRE ROPE SLING
* 1ea. 9FTWIRE ROPE SLING
37 |227961CH PARA 20' GRADE 100 CHAIN 2 |$ 3900 78000 NosBid No Bid
38 |300115 Steel Locking D Carabiner Black 20 S 34.40 | $ 688.00 | $ 3324 | $ 664.80 | $ 33.25 | ¢ 665.00
39 (300990 Roof Anchor 4 No Bid discontinued No Bid
40 |430402 Rope Bag #4 Blue 2 s 8150 |$  163.00]$ 7875 |$  157.50 | S 7875|%  157.50
) , 625
41 |281202-1/2" Blue and White Rope feet | $ 117|s  73125]$ 114|$  71250] 8 115|$ 71875
355413 Alta Super Flex Knee Pads 4 |s 3176 | S 127.04]$ 3068 | S 12272 3375|$  135.00
42 |501139 Truck Cache 1 |$ 267650|$ 2,67650]$ 2558523 | $ 2,58523| S 2,585.00 | $ 2,585.00
43 |331601 Traverse Mule Il Litter Wheel 1 [$ 922108 92210[$ 89063 |$ 89063 |$ 1,032.00|$ 1,032.00
44 |721710 Half Back Harness 1 |$ 136100]$ 1,361.00]$ 1314.60 | $ 1,31460|$ 1,361.00|% 1,361.00
45 |721 711 Vertical Lift Assy 1 |$  26800[|$  26800]$ 25886 | S 25886|S  25890|S 25890




46 (240029 Proseries Radio Harness 4 |s 71.20 | S 284.80 | S 7239 | S 289.56 | S 74.95 | $ 299.80
47 (509001 Lock Out Tag Out Kit 1 S 287.10 | $ 287.10| S 277.27 | S 277.27 | S 287.00 | $ 287.00
48 (724133 Vertical Lift Harness 1 S 198.50 | $ 198.50 | $ 191.70 | $ 191.70 | $ 191.70 | $ 191.70
49 (752201 SKED Rescue System Cobra 1 S 670.60 | S 670.60 | $ 647.73 | S 647.73 | $ 670.60 | $ 670.60
50 |721100 LSP Miller Full Body Splint 1 S 910.00 | $ 910.00 | $ 859.44 | S 859.44 | $ 931.95 | $ 931.95
51 [564060 Rescue Max Kit 1 S 361770 |$ 3,617.70| $ 3,416.67 | S 3,416.67|S 3,495.00|S 3,495.00
52 294358 Shrink Tubing 2 S 0.66 | $ 132]$ 0.66 | S 132]$ 0.70 | $ 1.40
53 [501358 Rope Rescue Team Kit 1 S 9986.15|S$ 9,986.15|$ 9,431.33 |S 943133|S 9,64570|S 9,645.70
54 3944 005 0072 36RDR 72E CARBIDE 12
CHAIN S 193.05 | $  2,316.60 | No Bid No Bid
55 0835 070 8000 Cutting Wheel D-GBO 4
350Mm/14" S 224.60 | S 898.40 | No Bid No Bid
56 MS462RCM-20 MS462RCM 20 36RDR 1
RESCUE S 1,273.00 |$ 1,273.00 | No Bid No Bid
57 |TS420TS420-66.7cc-4.4bph-14" 1 S 969.00 | $ 969.00 | No Bid No Bid
58 7010 871 0240 1 GALLON STIHL BAR & 1
CHAIN OIL, WOOD CUTTER S 52.50 | $ 52.50 | No Bid No Bid
59 [7450001 ECHO POWER FUEL 3202 12 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
HMVPGITFT 1.5NH 70-200GPM
60 |MIDMATIC NOZZLE, W/ SHUTOFF AND 2
GRIP S 735.00 | S  1,470.00 | No Bid S 1,099.00 | S 2,198.00
61 1030P UFS 1 NPSH RED 22GPM POLY )
COMBI NOZZLE S 8.20 | S 16.40 | No Bid S 19.00 | $ 38.00
62 |UFCWZICO FOAM PAIL WRENCH 1 S 11.85 | $ 11.85 | No Bid S 15.00 | $ 15.00
3540N40N 35 4NHFRLX4NHFRL DOUBLE
63 FEMALE SWIVEL ADAPTER MALE ADAPTER ! .
S 75.45 | $ 75.45 | No Bid S 63.00 | S 63.00
64 | 3740N25N 37 ANHFRLX2.5NHM ADAPTER| 1 S 44.85 | $ 44.85 | No Bid S 69.60 | ¢ 69.60
65 [3725N40N 37 2.5NHFRLX4NHM ADAPTER | 2 S 47.10 | $ 94.20 | No Bid S 64.35 | ¢ 128.70
3525N25N 35 2.5NHFRLX2.5NHFRL
66 DOUBLE FEMALE SWIVEL ADAPTER 2 S 26.55 | $ 53.10 | No Bid S 24.95 | $ 49.90
67 3625N25N 2.5NHMX2.5NHM RL DBL )
MALE ADPTR S 14.80 | $ 29.60 | No Bid S 14.45 | $ 28.90
68 3725N15N 37 2.5NHFRLX1 .5NHM 1
ADAPTER S 15.90 | $ 15.90 | No Bid S 13.80 | $ 13.80
3515N15N 35 1.5NHFRLX1.5NHFRL
69 DOUBLE FEMALE SWIVEL ADAPTER ! S 16.75 | S 16.75 | No Bid S 18.40 | $ 18.40
70 3615N15N 361.5NHMX1 .5NHM ROCKER 1
LUG DOUBLE MALE ADAPTER S 10.15 | S 10.15 | No Bid S 11.50 | $ 11.50
71 3715N75G 371 .5NHFRLX.75GHTM 1
ADAPTER S 13.45 | $ 13.45 | No Bid S 14.45 | $ 14.45
6001 BTR TOOLS EZSPANNER ONE HOLE
72 |PUSH BUTTON ADJUSTABLE HYDRANT 1
WRENCH S 168.50 | $ 168.50 | No Bid No Bid
73 107 RH ADJUSTABLE HYDRANT WRENCH 1
WITH SINGLE SPANNER HEAD .
S 33.60 | S 33.60 | No Bid S 48.20 | $ 48.20
74 [440YL RBFAB HYDRANT TOOL BAG 1 S 26.00 | $ 26.00 | No Bid S 35.00 | $ 35.00
75 495272021 M18 FUEL SAWZALL KITWITH 1
ONE BATTERY S 363.15 | $ 363.15 | No Bid No Bid
495-6519-31 SAWZALL RECIPROCATING
76 SAW KIT, WITH CARRYING CASE. ! . .
S 160.95 | $ 160.95 | No Bid No Bid
77 36561 NUPLA RH6DA 6" ROOF VENT 4
HOOK WITH ALUM D-GRIP S 91.60 | S 365.60 | $ 9493 | S 379.72 | $ 119.75 | $ 479.00




78

36126 NUPLA YPDH-6A 6' HD CLASSIC
NUPLAGLAS PIKE POLE, WITH ALUM D-
HANDLE

75.25

S 150.50

S 77.96

155.92

$

98.35

$ 196.70

79

36132 NUPLA YPDH-12A 12' HD CLASSIC
NUPLAGLAS PIKE POLE, WITH ALUM D-
HANDLE

95.80

S 191.60

S 99.27

198.54

125.25

S 250.50

80

35254 NUPLA CWH-6YDA 6' HD CLASSIC
CEILING WALL HOOK WITH ALUM D-
HANDLE

107.30

S 214.60

S 111.18

222.36

140.30

S 280.60

81

28PW-6 FIRE AXE 28" 6# POLISHED
PICKHEAD FIREFIGHTER AXE WITH WOOD
HANDLE

223.55

S 894.20

No Bid

220.00

S 880.00

82

28FW-6 FIRE AXE 28" 6# POLISHED
FLATHEAD FIREFIGHTER AXE WITH WOOD
HANDLE

223.55

S 447.10

No Bid

220.00

S 440.00

83

PB-30 FIRE HOOKS 30" PRO-BAR
WITHOUT RING

211.80

S 423.60

No Bid

215.00

S 430.00

84

27100 NUPLA BD-10-32 10LB 32"
NUPLAGLAS CLASSIC SLEDGE HAMMER
WITH CIRCULAR STRIPE GRIP

44.15

S 44.15

S 457.73

457.73

$

57.70

$ 57.70

85

F32N-T LONESTAR 8# PIG DEMOLITION
TOOL, NOTCHED WITH 32" TAN
FIBERGLASS HANDLE

190.60

S 190.60

S 187.00

187.00

No Bid

86

KT K-TOOL KIT, INCLUDES: * K-TOOL, *
LEATHER POUCH, * SET OF KEY TOOLS, *
OPERATIONS MANUAL

112.95

S 225.90

No Bid

$

129.00

$ 258.00

87

910-1120 TM PST DD-18-H-4.8 18" DIRECT
DRIVE BLOWER W/ 4.8HP HONDA ENGINE

1,718.50

w

3,437.00

No Bid

$

2,069.00

w

4,138.00

88

889RD RBFAB RUBBLE BAG

61.60

w

61.60

No Bid

$

80.30

w

80.30

89

SCOTT-p/n8003070 / X-SERIES CAMERA
WITH STANDARD HOT AND COLD SPOT
TRACKER, 2X/4X ZOOM AND TWO
BATTERIES, SHIPS WITH A LANYARD,
DESKTOP AND TRUCK MOUNT CHARGER
IN A HARD-SIDED CASE. PRICE INCLUDES
TWO YEARS OF EXTENDED WARRANTY,
FOR A TOTAL OF FIVE YEARS’ COVERAGE.
FARENHEIT

6,990.00

S  6,990.00

9,963.93

$

9,963.93

10,561.80

$ 10,561.80

Subtotal

122,260.56

43,228.02

46,506.10

Tax (7.75%)

9,475.19

3,350.17

3,604.22

Freight

500.00

Total

v | |n|[n|wn

131,735.75

W |n|n|nln

47,078.19

W |n|n|nln

50,110.32




