Bid Number: RFB 20-022
CITY OF RIALTO Bid Due Date: 10/15/2019
Vendors Solicitated: 354
ABSTRACT OF BIDS
VENDOR Fire Apparatus Solutions | Amkus Rescue Systems Rescue
PHONE (909) 879-7354 (800) 592-6587 (702) 526-1538
LOCATION Rialto, CA Valparaiso, IN Las Vegas, NV
CONTACT William Kalmikov Alice Huball Peggy Burch
ITEM DESCRIPTION PART # QTY. UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
001 |Combi (tool only select battery/charger kit below) ICT516 4 | $8,910.00 |$35,640.00 | $9,900.00 |$39,600.00 | $9,900.00 |[$39,600.00
Combi Mount:
Heavy Rescue Tool Mount Kit with Fastlock
002 | (Strap color offered in black, yellow & orange) K5035FL 4 $202.50 $810.00 No Bid No Bid
Combi Battery Kit
Includes two 12/4 amp-HR 60 volt batteries and single
003 |charger BATT12-KIT 4 $675.00 $2,700.00 $340.00 $1,360.00 $750.00 $3,000.00
004 [Cutter (tool only) IC550LB 1 $8,532.00 | $8,532.00 | $9,480.00 | $9,480.00 | $9,480.00 | $9,480.00
Cutter Mount:
Heavy Rescue Tool Mount Kit with Fastlock
005 | (Strap color offered in black, yellow & orange) K5035FL 1 $202.50 $202.50 No Bid No Bid
006 |ION Spreader- light handle (tool only) IS280LB-L 1 [$10,503.00 |$10,503.00 |$11,160.00 |$11,160.00 |[$11,670.00 |$11,670.00
Spreader Accessory:
Extended Reach Tips- AMK-24, AMK-30CRT & ION
007 |Spreads (1 pair) KS0029-KIT 1 $877.50 $877.50 $975.00 $975.00 $975.00 $975.00
Spreader Accessory:
Chain package, quick adjust AMK-24/30CRT, ION
008 |Spreaders K-CHAIN-24-30| 1 $810.00 $810.00 $900.00 $900.00 $900.00 $900.00
Spreader Mount:
Heavy Rescue Tool Mount Kit with Fastlock
009 | (Strap color offered in black, yellow & orange) K5035FL 1 $202.50 $202.50 No Bid No Bid
010 [ITR230 Ram (tool only) ITR230LB 1 | $7,470.00 | $7,470.00 | $8,300.00 [ $8,300.00 | $8,300.00 | $8,300.00
RAM Accessory:
3 piece RAM extention Kit (includes 10", 18" & 27"
011 [extensions) AMK-TCE-KIT 1 $1,125.00 | $1,125.00 | $1,250.00 | $1,250.00 | $1,300.00 | $1,300.00
RAM Mount:
012 |RAM bsae mount kit with Fastlok K1022FL 1 $140.40 $140.40 No Bid No Bid
013 |Dewalt ION FlexVolt battery charger (4 bay charger) DCB104 1 $275.00 $275.00 $265.00 $265.00 $365.00 $365.00
014 |Two 6/2 AMP-HR 60 volt batteries & single charger BATT6-KIT 1 $675.00 $675.00 $340.00 $340.00 $750.00 $750.00
SUBTOTAL $69,962.90 $73,630.00 $76,340.00
TAX (7.75%) $5,422.12 $5,706.33 $5,916.35
FREIGHT| $ - $350.00 $675.00
TOTAL $75,385.02 $79,686.33 $82,931.35




